Analysis of Final Bids

Note: Not all suppliers chose to bid on each box. Low Bid per Item was based upon companies submitting a bid.

Release | Annual C.O.P.S. Low Bid
Box # Quantity [ Quantity | Current Cost |Projected Cost| Supplier #1 Supplier #2 Supplier #3 Supplier #4 Supplier #5 Supplier #6 per ltem
P 100 5,000 42,000 $292.00 $160.86 $240.00 $198.00 $168.51 $160.85 $199.00 $212.15 $160.85
P 101 4,800 250,220 $285.00 $160.00 $210.00 $197.00 $170.78 $160.00 $170.00 $176.50 $160.00
P 105 5,000 29,000 $313.00 $166.93 $245.00 $205.00 $172.05 $166.93 $198.00 $216.95 $166.93
P 108 3,000 9,000 $520.00 $277.63 $425.00 $390.00 $275.97 $277.63 $312.00 $364.10 $275.97
P 219 5,000 21,000 $377.00 $193.68 $325.00 $247.00 $204.09 $199.04 $218.00 $420.55 $199.04
P 221 5,000 18,200 $310.00 $231.12 $280.00 $149.00 $245.67 $231.12 $350.00 $331.10 $149.00
P 43 1,000 59,580 $413.00 $135.55 $280.00 $147.00 $138.51 $135.55 $154.00 $160.65 $135.55
P 46 5,000 37,660 $222.00 $126.83 $180.00 $162.00 $134.45 $126.83 $150.00 $178.50 $126.83
P 49 25,000 73,500 $327.00 $218.12 $270.00 No Bid $229.03 $218.12 No Bid $312.50 $218.12
P51 3,000 3,182 $310.00 $295.92 $425.00 $337.00 $292.93 $295.92 No Bid $372.40 $292.93
P 54 3,000 11,400 $360.00 $188.66 $270.00 $233.00 $213.00 $188.66 $237.00 $274.00 $188.66
P 66 4,000 156,000 $373.00 $204.27 $270.00 $239.00 $217.88 $204.27 $216.00 $317.85 $204.27
P 77 5,000 18,240 $160.00 $82.83 $180.00 $940.00 $96.86 $86.18 No Bid $140.80 $86.18
P78 1,000 1,000 $2,650.00 $1,205.00 $2,200.00 $1,730.00 $1,379.26 $1,848.84 $1,580.00 $1,652.25 | $1,379.26
P 81 25,000 | 151,200 $310.00 $217.48 $280.00 $275.00 $222.85 $217.48 $285.00 $312.50 $217.48
P 82 30,000 |1,101,100 $327.00 $216.72 $270.00 $272.00 $219.40 $216.72 $285.00 $311.90 $216.72
P 84 1,375 1,375 $245.00 $231.00 $275.00 $237.00 $230.87 $278.26 $239.00 $426.30 $230.87
P 86 3,000 17,720 $233.00 $125.40 $185.00 $167.00 $131.99 $125.39 $165.00 $214.65 $125.39
P 89 3,000 18,000 $316.00 $166.09 $250.00 $208.00 $178.18 $166.09 $230.00 $252.30 $166.09
P 93 5,000 22,800 $306.00 $154.47 $230.00 $181.00 $160.50 $154.47 $195.00 $204.95 $154.47
P 95 10,000 60,100 $303.00 $165.59 $235.00 $195.00 $163.62 $165.58 $184.00 $189.90 $163.62

Total Bid on all Items $679,013.52| $419,479.79] $547,973.78| $513,665.07| $431,318.11| $420,361.08| $502,997.85| $590,576.46




